BID TABULATION
Video Equipment
June 25, 2009 at 11:00 am CDT

Video Services

VENDORS ECS, Inc. Specialized of America
Communications
(IEC contract)
Line Item| Description
Bid Submittal Form
Video Equipment
1 (2) tripod, 501HDV pro video head
Unit price $420.00 $405.00 $362.25
Extended price $840.00 $810.00 $724.50
2 (1) Monopod, pro fluid monopod $260.00 $285.00 $248.40
3 (1) DVD/SVHS recorder $440.00 $485.00 $445.05
4 (2) Memory cards, 32 GB
Unit price $115.00 No bid
Extended price $230.00
5 (2) stand alone lights, basic 3 light kit
Unit price $990.00 $1,045.00
Extended price $1,980.00 $2,090.00
6 (1) CD player $285.00 No bid $279.45
7 (2) Handheld digital camcorders
Unit price $1,695.00 $1,840.00 $1,743.98
Extended price $3,390.00 $3,680.00 $3,487.96
8 (2) camera cases
Unit price $204.00 $185.00 $201.83
Extended price $408.00 $370.00 $403.66
9 (2) Additional AC adaptor/battery charger
Unit price $116.00 $112.00 $113.85
Extended price $232.00 $224.00 $227.70
10 (2) 0.7X wide angle conversion lens
Unit price $175.00 $170.00 $168.71
Extended price $350.00 $340.00 $337.42
(2) Additional 7.2 v 5,800 mA camcorder
11 battery
Unit price $160.00 No bid $155.25
Extended price $320.00 $310.50
12 (2) 16 GB secure digital cards




BID TABULATION
Video Equipment
June 25, 2009 at 11:00 am CDT

Video Services

VENDORS ECS, Inc. Specialized of America
Communications
(IEC contract)
Line Item Description

Unit price $90.00 No bid

Extended price $180.00
13 (2) Wireless microphones w/ battery pk

Unit price $495.00 $485.00

Extended price $990.00 $970.00
14 (2) Hand held corded microphones

Unit price $125.00 $105.00

Extended price $250.00 $210.00
15 (1) DVD/VHS recorder/player combo $185.00 $189.00
16 (1) Shark copier light scribe $645.00 No bid

Computer Equipment

1 (1) HP Workstation $1,985.00 No bid
2 (1) HP Monitor $1,265.00 No bid
3 (1) Soundstick Il speaker system $135.00 No bid $126.27
4 (2)1 GB ECC FBD

Unit price $118.00 No bid

Extended price $236.00
5 (1) PCI front fan kit $50.00 No bid
6 (1) Radeon HD graphics card $240.00 No bid
7 (2) 1 TB 7200 rpm SATA-enterprise

Unit price $225.00 No bid

Extended price $450.00
8 (2) 18" right angle serial ATA Cable No bid

Unit price $5.00

Extended price $10.00
9 (1) EDIUS 4.5 keyboard $120.00 No bid
10 (1) HDSTORM EDIUS software $1,410.00 $1,550.00
11 (1) TitleMotion Pro for EDIUS $264.00 $257.88
12 Cabling No bid No bid
12 Total Price for all Equipment $17,150.00

On-site set-up $630.00




BID TABULATION
Video Equipment
June 25, 2009 at 11:00 am CDT

Video Services

VENDORS ECS, Inc. Specialized of America
Communications
(IEC contract)
Line Item Description
13 Cost for Training $410.00 $750.00
14 Hours for Training 4 Hours 4 Hours
set up & training
15 How much technical support included only 8 Hours
What is cost and basis for future tech
16 support No Response
Cost $29.95
Cost Basis 15 Minutes
17 Estimated time to delivery & install equip 30 Days 30 Days
18 Estimated time to complete project 30 Days 60 Days
Signature Page
1 Exceptions None No exceptions
2 Piggybacking? Yes Yes
3 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment? Yes No
4 Quick Pay Discount N/A N/A
5 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard? N/A N/A




