
BID TABULATION FORM
LED TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULES - BID #0709-023

SEPTEMBER 1, 2009 AT 2:30 PM

Description Qty Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended

Pedestrian head, assembled, 1-
section countdown with 12" LED 
and side-of-pole mounting hardware

100

Price:  no bid  $ 112.00  $ 11,200.00  $   297.00  $   29,700.00  no bid  $ 240.00  $ 24,000.00  $ 348.00  $ 34,800.00  $ 275.00  $ 27,500.00 
Pedestrian LED module, 1-section 
countdown, 12" LED (lamp 
replacement only)

70

Price:  $ 156.00  $ 10,920.00  $   179.00  $   12,530.00  $ 83.53  $ 5,847.10  $ 133.00  $   9,310.00  $ 210.00  $ 14,700.00  $ 136.50  $   9,555.00 
Amber LED module, 12" 
incandescent look 100

Price:  $   58.00  $   5,800.00  $     58.00  $     5,800.00  $ 74.12  $ 7,412.00  $   95.50  $   9,550.00  $   74.00  $   7,400.00  $   63.00  $   6,300.00 
Red LED module, 12" incandescent 
look 50

Price:  $   36.00  $   1,800.00  $     42.25  $     2,112.50  $ 48.07  $ 2,403.50  $   48.75  $   2,437.50  $   50.00  $   2,500.00  $   40.75  $   2,037.50 
Green LED module, 12" 
incandescent look 50

Price:  $   50.00  $   2,500.00  $     61.00  $     3,050.00  $ 70.18  $ 3,509.00  $   83.50  $   4,175.00  $   72.00  $   3,600.00  $   52.75  $   2,637.50 
Amber arrow LED module, 12" 
incandescent look 40

Price:  $   40.00  $   1,600.00  $     50.50  $     2,020.00  $ 50.09  $ 2,003.60  $   50.00  $   2,000.00  $   66.00  $   2,640.00  $   40.50  $   1,620.00 
Green arrow LED module, 12" 
incandescent look 40

Price:  $   47.00  $   1,880.00  $     47.50  $     1,900.00  $ 57.13  $ 2,285.20  $   55.50  $   2,220.00  $   61.00  $   2,440.00  $   44.25  $   1,770.00 
Amber LED module, 12" limited 
vision 20

Price:  $   50.00  $   1,000.00  $     50.50  $     1,010.00  no bid  $   72.25  $   1,445.00  $   58.00  $   1,160.00  $   44.50  $      890.00 
Green LED module, 12" limited 
vision 20

Price:  $   50.00  $   1,000.00  $     73.75  $     1,475.00  no bid  $   94.50  $   1,890.00  $   93.00  $   1,860.00  $   68.25  $   1,365.00 

Red LED module, 12" limited vision 20

Price:  $   50.00  $   1,000.00  $     50.50  $     1,010.00  no bid  $   72.25  $   1,445.00  $   58.00  $   1,160.00  $   44.00  $      880.00 

 $   60,607.50  $ 58,472.50  $ 72,260.00  $ 54,555.00 

 EOI TRV-G12SG-D23T 

Excellence Opto, Inc.

 EOI TRP-
C45D3154C10 

 EOI TRV-Y12GD - DIT 

 EOI TRV-R12SG-D2T 

 Leotek TO5G-A-CA01 

 Leotek TO5R-A-6100 

General Traffic 
Controls, Inc.

 PEEK Housing; Leotek 
LED; Pelco Brackets  no bid 

Total for all units listed above:

 EOI TRA-G12DG-IN 

 ELECTRO-TECH 
PV18X10YL 

 Leotek TSL-12GA-LD-
A1 

 Leotek TO5Y-A-6100 

 Leotek TSL-12YA-LD-
A1 

 Dialight P463Y33003 

Brown Traffic Products, 
Inc.

 Siemens 
SG7SZ10C1BBF; Brown 
MV-4041-P02; Dialight 

430-6479-001X 

 Dialight 430-6479-001X 

 Dialight 433-3230-901XL 

 Dialight 431-3334-
901XOD 

 Dialight P463G33003 

 Dialight P463R33003 

 no bid 

 no bid 

 no bid 

 no bid 

 Dialight 433-1210-0003XL 

 Dialight 433-2270-001XL 

 Dialight 432-2324-
001XOD 

TraStar, Inc.

 LED:  Duralight JXM-
200VIE; housing:  TPI 

SIG-PPY-326-TTN-EVN-
ON 

 no bid 

 no bid 

 EOI TRA-Y12DG-IN  no bid 

 no bid 

 no bid 

 ELECTRO-TECH 
PV30X6BG 

 ELECTRO-TECH 
PV18X1D 

Traffic Parts, Inc.

 TPI/Duralight SSPED-
PFN-Q2N-N; SIDE-01B-

3NA-AA1-NA 

TPI/Duralight 7524

TPI/Duralight 7611

TPI/Duralight 7430

TPI/Duralight 7432

TPI/Duralight 7746

 Leotek LED TSL-Ped-
16-CIL-9 

 Leotek TSL-12Y-LX-
IL3-A1-C 

 Leotek TSL-12R-LX-
IL3-A1-C 

 Leotek TSL-12G-LX-
IL3-A1-C 

Mid American 
Signal, Inc.

TPI/Duralight 7747

Electrotechs 6798

Electrotechs 6799

 DR6-RTFB-17A-GE 

 Duralight JXC-300 
HFTG  DR6-GCFB-17A-GE 

 Duralight JXJ300-
07Y03 

 DR6-YTAAN-17A-YX-
GE 

 Duralight JXJ300-
07G03 

Electrotechs 6797

Traffic Control Corp

 no bid PS6-PFD1-26A-GE    
Econolite Head 

 Duralight JXM-
200VIE  PS6-PFD1-26A-GE 

 Duralight JXC-
300HFTY02 

 DR6-YCFB-17A-YX1-
GE 

 Duralight JXC-
300HFTR 

 DR6-GCAAN-17A-GE 

 no bid  DR3-YCFB-01A-GE 

 no bid  DR3-GCFB-01A-GE 

 no bid  DR3-RCFB-01A-GE 

SUPPLIERS



BID TABULATION FORM
LED TRAFFIC SIGNAL MODULES - BID #0709-023

SEPTEMBER 1, 2009 AT 2:30 PM

Excellence Opto, Inc. General Traffic 
Controls, Inc.

Brown Traffic Products, 
Inc.TraStar, Inc. Traffic Parts, Inc.Mid American 

Signal, Inc. Traffic Control CorpSUPPLIERS

 Countdown:  60 mos.; 
Housing:  12 mos. 

Pricing firm for 12 months?

Lead time:

 Standard 5 yrs 

 Yes 

 within 30 days 

 No 

1

 30-45 days 

 None  None 

 LED's 5 yrs; All other 
equipment 1 yr 

 Yes 

 60 days 

 LED warranty is 5 
years 

 Yes 

Exceptions:

Piggyback?

Addenda:

Warranty Information:

 Yes 

1 1

 No 

 None Quick pay discount:

Accept MasterCard?  No 

 None 

 Yes 

 Yes 

 None 

Signature Page

 No 

 None 

 Yes 

1, 2

 None 

 No 

1

 30-60 days 

 None 

 Yes 

 None 

 5 yr PED & traffic 
signal LED's; ltd vision 

 Yes 

 60 days 

 Yes 

 None 

 5 year mfg warranty  5 years 

 Yes 

 Yes  Yes 

 60 days  30 days 

 None  None 

1 1

 Yes  Yes 

 None  None 

 Yes 


