
BID TABULATION FORM

COMMERCIAL WATER METERS SUPPLIES - RFB #PUR0516-196

JUNE 9, 2016 AT 3:00 PM

Description Qty  Unit Price  Extended Price  Alternate Product Description  Unit Price  Extended Price 

NEW TURBO METERS

2” 1,000 CU. FT. ECR Turbo Meter with touch pad 8  $        443.34  $           3,546.72 
 Recordall T-200 w/ HR-E & touch pad, 

less connections 
 $        512.00  $           4,096.00 

3” 1,000 CU. FT. ECR Turbo Meter with touch pad 4  $        604.13  $           2,416.52 
 Recordall T-450 w/ HR-E & touch pad, 

less connections 
 $        585.00  $           2,340.00 

4” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR Turbo Meter with touch pad 2  $    1,056.00  $           2,112.00 
 Recordall T-1000 w/ HR-E & touch 

pad, less connections 
 $        866.00  $           1,732.00 

6” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR Turbo Meter with touch pad 2  $    1,755.03  $           3,510.06 
 Recordall T-2000 w/ HR-E & touch 

pad, less connections 
 $    2,080.00  $           4,160.00 

8” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR Turbo Meter with touch pad 2  $    3,063.90  $           6,127.80 
 Recordall T-3500 w/ HR-E & touch 

pad, less connections 
 $    2,321.00  $           4,642.00 

10” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR Turbo Meter with touch pad 1  $    4,947.60  $           4,947.60 
 Recordall T-5500 w/ HR-E & touch 

pad, less connections 
 $    3,172.00  $           3,172.00 

MEASURING CHAMBERS WITH REGISTER

2” 1,000 CU. FT. ECR MMP Chamber with touch pad 6  $        247.06  $           1,482.36  for T-200  $        357.89  $           2,147.34 

3” 1,000 CU. FT. ECR MMP Chamber with touch pad 3  $        370.59  $           1,111.77  for T-450  $        414.63  $           1,243.89 

4” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR MMP Chamber with touch pad 2  $        494.12  $              988.24  for T-1000  $        425.10  $              850.20 

6” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR MMP Chamber with touch pad 2  $        741.18  $           1,482.36  for T-2000  $    1,162.70  $           2,325.40 

8” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR MMP Chamber with touch pad 1  $        988.24  $              988.24  for T-3500  $    1,324.19  $           1,324.19 

10” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR MMP Chamber with touch pad 1  $    1,235.30  $           1,235.30  for T-5500  $    1,794.68  $           1,794.68 

NEW COMPOUND METERS

2” 1,000 CU. FT. ECR Compound Meter with touch pad 6  $    1,021.43  $           6,128.58  $    1,099.00  $           6,594.00 

3” 1,000 CU. FT. ECR Compound Meter with touch pad 4  $    1,402.43  $           5,609.72  $    1,311.00  $           5,244.00 

4” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR Compound Meter with touch pad 2  $    1,971.19  $           3,942.38  $    2,075.00  $           4,150.00 

6” 10,000 CU. FT. ECR Compound Meter with touch pad 1  $    3,151.06  $           3,151.06  $    2,984.00  $           2,984.00 

NEW HYDRANT METERS

3” Hydrant Meter with CU.FT. Register 4  $        580.67  $           2,322.68 
 Recordall T-450 fire hydrant meter w/ 

connections & valve, local read 
 $        745.00  $           2,980.00 

3” Hydrant Meter Measuring Chamber with Cu. Ft. Register 4  $        350.00  $           1,400.00  for T-450  $        352.63  $           1,410.52 

Suppliers:
Badger Meter, Inc.

Milwaukee, WI

 Recordall Compounds Meters w/ (2) 

HR-Es and (2) BadgerTouch modules 

less connections 

Ferguson Waterworks

Dekalb, IL



BID TABULATION FORM

COMMERCIAL WATER METERS SUPPLIES - RFB #PUR0516-196

JUNE 9, 2016 AT 3:00 PM

Description Qty  Unit Price  Extended Price  Alternate Product Description  Unit Price  Extended Price 

Suppliers:
Badger Meter, Inc.

Milwaukee, WI

Ferguson Waterworks

Dekalb, IL

SR METERS

8 lots, 16 each, ¾” x ¾” SR 100 CU. FT. ECR Meter with 

touch pad (new)
128  $        102.84  $        13,163.52 

 Recordall M35, cast iron bottom w/ 

HR-E & BadgerTouch module, less 

connections 

 $        102.00  $        13,056.00 

10 lots, 12 each, 1” x 1” SR 100 CU. FT. ECR Meter with 

touch pad (new)
120  $        140.72  $        16,886.40 

 Recordall M55, cast iron bottom w/ 

HR-E & BadgerTouch module, less 

connections 

 $        130.00  $        15,600.00 

1 lot of 12, 1 ½” SR 1,000 CU.FT. ECR Meter w/ touch pad 

flanged end (new)
12  $        296.08  $           3,552.96 

 Recordall M120, elliptical w/ HR-E & 

BadgerTouch module, less connectins 
 $        288.00  $           3,456.00 

6 lots, 12 each 1 ½” SR 1,000 CU. FT. ECR Meter with touch 

pad screwed end (new)
72  $        296.08  $        21,317.76 

 Recordall M120, hexl w/ HR-E & 

BadgerTouch module, less connections 
 $        288.00  $        20,736.00 

METER COUPLINGS
C38-23 2.5 ¾” Ford Meter Couplings (minimum order of 

100)
1400  $            9.70  no bid  $                       -   

C38-44 2.625 1” Ford Meter Couplings (minimum order of 

20)
800  $          14.95  no bid  $                       -   

1 ½” Threaded Meter Coupling with bushing 144  $          88.71  no bid  $                       -   

METER FLANGES

CR31-66 1 ½” Ford Meter Flanges 10  $          43.24  no bid  $                       -   

CF31-77 2” Ford Meter Flanges 72  $          56.45  no bid  $                       -   

METER STRAINER

2” Meter strainer 1  $        305.00  $              305.00  with studs, nuts and gasket  $        262.00  $              262.00 

4” Meter strainer 1  $        590.00  $              590.00  with studs, nuts and gasket  $        489.00  $              489.00 

6” Meter strainer 1  $    1,100.00  $           1,100.00  with studs, nuts and gasket  $        679.00  $              679.00 

8” Meter strainer 1  $    2,025.00  $           2,025.00  with studs, nuts and gasket  $    1,076.00  $           1,076.00 

10” Meter strainer 1  $    3,400.00  $           3,400.00  with studs, nuts and gasket  $    2,008.00  $           2,008.00 

12” Meter strainer 1  $    7,445.00  $           7,445.00  with studs, nuts and gasket  $    2,456.00  $           2,456.00 

TRICON TRANSMITTERS

Tricon Transmitters in 5/8” through 10” (or equivalent) TBD  $        500.00  no bid 
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Suppliers:
Badger Meter, Inc.

Milwaukee, WI

Ferguson Waterworks

Dekalb, IL

FIRE SERVICE METERS

4” Protectus III SS Meter CF Pro HP BY (or equivalent) TBD  $    5,250.00  $    4,429.00 

6” Protectus III SS Meter CF Pro HP BY (or equivalent) TBD  $    9,375.00  $    6,159.00 

8” Protectus III SS Meter CF Pro HP BY (or equivalent) TBD  $  13,125.00  $    8,034.00 

10” Protectus III SS Meter CF Pro HP BY (or equivalent) TBD  $  14,740.00  $  11,734.00 

FIRE SERVICE METERS

Neptune R450 Fixed Base MIU (or equivalent) TBD  $          94.15  no bid 

Neptune R450 Fixed Base MIU Hi-Gain (or equivalent) TBD  $        114.50  no bid 

Neptune R900 Walk-by / Drive-by MIU (or equivalent) TBD  $          75.00  no bid 

Register MIU Bracket (or equivalent mount kit) TBD  $            6.12  no bid 

 $      107,424.03  $      106,038.22 

None

 24-32 calendar days 

 Mfg Warranty attached 

15%

1

Weighted total amount for quantities bid by both vendors:

Percentage off list price to be used for any replacement parts that are 

not listed above:

 Badger Meter Recordall Fire Service 

Assembly (FSAA-01) w/ (2) HR-Es and 

(2) BadgerTouch modules, less 

connections 

10%

Quick Pay Discount:

Warranty:

Lead Time:

Comments/Exceptions:

Addenda (1):

Accept Pcard?

 see descriptive literature 

 Yes 

 Neptune Mfg Warranty 

 15-30 calendar days 

 None 

1

 Yes 

None


