
BID TABULATION
Aluminum Sign Blanks

Bid #PUR0316-173

April 28, 2016 at 3:00pm

Line Item Description Qty Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended

panel sizes shall be 0.080" in Thickness,  

have 3/8" holes punched in each sign 

blanks and have 1" or 1.5" radii

66" x 8" 100 $7.12 $712.00 $10.10 $1,010.00 $8.13 $813.00 $10.35 $1,035.00 $7.36 $736.00 $7.19 $719.00

72" x 8" 100 $7.77 $777.00 $11.00 $1,100.00 $8.76 $876.00 $10.85 $1,085.00 $7.93 $793.00 $8.30 $830.00

42" x 12" 100 $6.80 $680.00 $9.65 $965.00 $7.41 $741.00 $11.45 $1,145.00 $6.71 $671.00 $7.01 $701.00

48" x 12" 80 $7.77 $621.60 $11.00 $880.00 $8.55 $684.00 $11.45 $916.00 $7.74 $619.20 $8.02 $641.60

54" x 12" 40 $8.74 $349.60 $12.40 $496.00 $11.44 $457.60 $13.15 $526.00 $10.30 $412.00 $9.02 $360.80

60" x 12" 100 $9.71 $971.00 $13.75 $1,375.00 $10.66 $1,066.00 $13.15 $1,315.00 $9.67 $967.00 $9.95 $995.00

66" x 12" 70 $10.68 $747.60 $15.15 $1,060.50 $12.11 $847.70 $13.90 $973.00 $10.96 $767.20 $11.42 $799.40

72" x 12" 70 $11.65 $815.50 $16.50 $1,155.00 $13.04 $912.80 $14.90 $1,043.00 $11.81 $826.70 $12.14 $849.80

78" x 12" 100 $12.62 $1,262.00 $17.90 $1,790.00 $13.51 $1,351.00 $15.90 $1,590.00 $12.25 $1,225.00 $13.16 $1,316.00

Total amount for items listed above

panel sizes shall be 0.125" in Thickness and 

have corners with 2.25" radii

90" x 24" 20 $44.45 $889.00 no bid $48.31 $966.20 $48.95 $979.00 $43.84 $876.80 $44.80 $896.00

102" x 24" 20 $50.38 $1,007.60 no bid $54.23 $1,084.60 $55.05 $1,101.00 $49.24 $984.80 $52.27 $1,045.40

108" x 24" 20 $53.34 $1,066.80 no bid $57.21 $1,144.20 $58.10 $1,162.00 $51.95 $1,039.00 $55.96 $1,119.20

114" x 24" 20 $56.31 $1,126.20 no bid $60.19 $1,203.80 $61.20 $1,224.00 $54.66 $1,093.20 $54.85 $1,097.00

120" x 24" 20 $59.27 $1,185.40 no bid $61.72 $1,234.40 $64.25 $1,285.00 $56.12 $1,122.40 $59.59 $1,191.80

126" x 24" 20 $62.23 $1,244.60 no bid $66.17 $1,323.40 $67.30 $1,346.00 $60.10 $1,202.00 $60.60 $1,212.00

132" x 24" 20 $65.20 $1,304.00 no bid $69.13 $1,382.60 $70.35 $1,407.00 $62.80 $1,256.00 $65.58 $1,311.60

138" x 24" 20 $68.16 $1,363.20 no bid $72.09 $1,441.80 $76.10 $1,522.00 $65.50 $1,310.00 $68.64 $1,372.80

144" x 24" 20 $71.12 $1,422.40 no bid $73.62 $1,472.40 $76.50 $1,530.00 $66.96 $1,339.20 $71.60 $1,432.00
Total amount for items listed above

Total Bid Amount:

Warranty:

How long pricing is held for:

Estimated Delivery:

Exceptions:

Signature Page

1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment?

2 Quick Pay Discount

3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard?

Yes

net 30

N/A

N/A

N/A

Yes

Iowa Prison 

Industries

Anamosa, IA

No

$9,831.50

N/A

12 months

30 days

See bid

12 months, only for 

30-45 days

All or none, one time 

shipment

No

Award by all or none

N/A

6 month

12 months

21 days

No

N/A

N/A

as specified

12 months

N/A

$17,240.50 $17,890.40

12 months

45-60 days

No

30 days

$19,002.50 $21,184.00

15-30 days

Yes

standard

90 days

30-45 days

US Standard Sign

Franklin Park, IL

No

Vulcan Inc dba 

Vulcan Aluminum

Foley, AL

No

Protection Services 

Inc

Lemoyne, PA

No

MDSolutions

Plain City, OH

No

VENDORS

Vendor Location

Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No)

No

N/A

No

Hall Signs, Inc

Bloomington, IN

No

$17,545.50

$10,609.20 $11,253.40 $11,556.00 $10,223.40 $10,677.80

$6,936.30 $9,831.50 $7,749.10 $9,628.00 $7,017.10 $7,212.60


