
BID TABULATION FORM

HEALTH SERVICES - RFB #PUR1015-070

DECEMBER 3, 2015 @ 3:00 PM

Suppliers:
St. Luke's Work Well 

Solutions
MercyCare

C. J. Cooper & Associates, 

Inc.

Weland Clinical 

Laboratories, P.C.

Chiropractic Clinic of 

Iowa

Description Price Price Price Price Price

Physicals and Testing

Respirator Clearance Physicals  $                             57.00  $                            80.00  $                                       50.00  no bid  no bid 

New Police Officer/Fire Fighter Physicals  $                        1,433.00  $                          903.00  no bid  no bid  no bid 

New Police Officer ILEA Physicals  $                        1,433.00  $                          139.00  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Transit Driver Physical  $                             75.00  $                            80.00  $                                       73.00  no bid  no bid 

Bomb Squad Physical  $                           343.00  $                          261.00  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Clan Lab Physical  $                           191.00  $                          198.00  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Fit for Duty Physical  $                             90.00  $                          135.00  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Physical for Commercial Driver Fitness Determination  $                             96.00  $                            91.00  $                                       65.00  no bid  $                        75.00 

Treadmill Test with Interpretation  $                           350.00  no bid  no bid  no bid  no bid 

TB Testing (initial and recheck)  $                             15.00  no bid  no bid  $                                  7.20  no bid 

Service location  830 1st Ave NE  5264 Council St. NE  1325 Stamy Rd., Hiawatha  1911 1st Ave SE  214 Blairs Ferry Rd 

Notice required for new employee physicals  24-48 hours  24 hours  offer physicals once per week  n/a  same day 

Notice for OSHA required physicals for existing employees  24-48 hours  24 hours  1-6 days  n/a  same day 

Drug and Alcohol Testing

Drug Testing - DOT  $50 ($90 after hrs)  see bid  $42 ($115 after hrs)  $43 + confirmation  $45 ($70 after hrs) 

Drug Testing - non-DOT  $50 ($90 after hrs)  see bid 
 $18 ($93 after hrs) + $25/drug 

confirmation 
 $17.80 + confirmation 

 $17.50 + $30 GCMS 

($42.50 after hrs) 

Alcohol Testing - DOT

Alcohol Testing - non-DOT

Testing location during business hours  830 1st Ave NE  MercyCare North/South  1325 Stamy, Hiawatha  1911 1st Ave SE  214 Blairs Ferry Rd 

Testing location after hours  St. Luke's Hospital  Mercy Hospital  same  n/a  same 

Vaccinations

Hepatitis A  $102 / $204  $112.50 / $225  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Hepatitis B  $62 / $186  $111.50 / $334.50  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Twinrix  $140 / $420  $146.50 / $439.50  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Rabies $248  $                          406.50  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Flu Shot $25  $                            35.00  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Service location  830 1st Ave NE  5264 Council St. NE  n/a  n/a  n/a 

 on-site for 10+ 

Injury Care - New Patients
 pricing for urgent care - 

see bid for ER pricing 

99201 - Self limit / minor (10 minutes)  $76 ($105 urgent care)  $                            68.53  no bid  no bid  no bid 

99202 - Low to moderate severity (20 min)  $76 ($142 urgent care)  $                          118.37  no bid  no bid  no bid 

99203 - Moderate severity (30 min)  $93 ($208 urgent care)  $                          174.44  no bid  no bid  no bid 

 $14 breath/$24 w/ conf ($50 

after hrs incl conf) 
 $27 ($50 after hrs)  $31 ($60 after hrs)  $15 + confirmation  $20 ($45 after hrs) 
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99204 - Moderate to high severity (45 min)  $132 ($289 urgent care)  $                          267.89  no bid  no bid  no bid 

99205 - Moderate to high severity (60 min)  $175 ($270 urgent care)  $                          337.31  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Injury Care - Established Patients

99211 - Self-limit / minor (5 minutes)  $65 ($43 urgent care)  $                            39.16  no bid  no bid  no bid 

99212 - Low to moderate severity (10 min)  $65 ($83 urgent care)  $                            78.32  no bid  no bid  no bid 

99213 - Low to moderate severity (15 min)  $76 ($123 urgent care)  $                          120.15  no bid  no bid  no bid 

99214 - Moderate to high severity (25 min)  $107 ($185 urgent care)  $                          173.55  no bid  no bid  no bid 

99215 - Moderate to high severity (40 min)  $145 ($270 urgent care)  $                          234.07  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Injury Care Scenarios

Head Contusion  all prices for ER 

99284  $                        1,748.00  $                       1,089.90  no bid  no bid  no bid 

70450  $                        1,472.00  $                          905.56  no bid  no bid  no bid 

96374  $                           219.54  $                          285.91  no bid no bid  no bid 

Fracture

99283  $                           923.00  $                          525.93  no bid  no bid  no bid 

73610  $                           318.68  $                          194.52  no bid  no bid  no bid 

97530  $                           105.00  $                          102.26  no bid  no bid  no bid 

97001  $                           165.00  $                          204.34  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Laceration

12001  $                           712.07  $                          283.82  no bid  no bid  no bid 

90471  $                           120.75  $                            82.52  no bid  no bid  no bid 

99283  $                           923.00  $                          525.93  no bid  no bid  no bid 

90715  $                           120.75  $                            73.10  no bid  no bid  no bid 

Clinic location 830 1st Ave NE  5264 Council St. NE n/a n/a n/a

Urgent Care location various MercyCare North/South n/a n/a n/a

Emergency care location St. Luke's Hospital Mercy Hospital n/a n/a n/a

Certified local business? pending Yes Yes pending pending

Signature Page

Comments:
See bid for itemized 

pricing and addtnl fees

See bid for itemized 

pricing and addtnl fees
See bid for additional comments None None

Addenda: 1 1 1 1 1

Accept MasterCard? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes


