BID TABULATION
Sign Posts & Accessories
Bid #PUR0316-162
April 15, 2016 at 3:00pm

lowa Prision Lightle Enterprises . S-Square Tube .
VENDORS Industries of Ohio LLC MD Solutions Products Inc Xcessories Squared
Vendor Location Anamosa, |IA Frankfort, OH Plain City, OH Commerce City, CO Auburn, IL
Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No) No No No No No
Line Item Description Qty Price | Extended | Price | Extended Price | Extended Price Extended Price Extended
11' Sign Post 500 J $22.75 [ $11,375.000 $23.60( $11,800.00 $19.19| $9,595.00 $27.65| $13,825.00] $18.33[ $9,165.00
36" Anchor Post 250 $9.50 $2,375.00]  $9.44| $2,360.00 $9.33] $2,332.50 $10.19| $2,547.25 $7.62| $1,905.00
48" Anchor Post 250 | $11.50 | $2,875.00] $12.58| $3,145.00 $12.10| $3,025.00 $13.59| $3,396.25 $10.03] $2,507.50
18" Anchor Sleeve 100 § $7.70 $770.00]  $5.95 $595.00 $4.83| $483.00 no bid no bidj $4.44 $444.00
30" Sign Post Extension 300 $4.75 $1,425.00] $5.50] $1,650.00 $6.62| $1,986.00 $5.68] $1,704.90] $4.01 $1,203.00
18" Omni-Directional Soil Stabilizing Anchor
Sleeve 50 $35.00 [ $1,750.00§ $31.20( $1,560.00 $23.23| $1,161.50 no bid no bid $14.00 $700.00
Medium Corner Bold 1000 § $0.65 $650.00]  $0.49 $490.00 $0.40| $400.00 $0.81 $810.00} $0.38 $380.00
Flange Nut 1000 § $0.19 $190.00] $0.15 $145.00 $0.04 $40.00 $0.15 $150.00] $0.09 $90.00
Breakaway Surface Mount 50 | $111.55[ $5,577.50] $176.50 $8,825.00]  $98.00( $4,900.00] no bid no bidI $57.00] $2,850.00
PVC Spacer 500 $0.07 $35.00] $0.17 $85.00] $0.22| $110.008 no bid no bid $0.24 $120.00
Total Bid Amount: $27,022.50] $30,655.00 $24,033.00 $22,433.40] $19,364.50
Warranty: Standard 12 months 12 months
How long pricing is held for: 12months 12 months 60 days 12 months 12 months
Estimated Delivery: 45 days 30-45 days 45 days 4-6 weeks 30 days
Exceptions See bid
Signature Page

1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment? Yes No Yes Yes

2 Quick Pay Discount Net 30 Net 30 N/A 1% 10 days

3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard? No Yes




