BID TABULATION
Trees
Bid #PUR0216-144
March 14, 2016 at 3:00pm

VENDORS BladeWorks Fleming Nursery Greg's L""W.“ & Hughes Nursery Midwest Lawn & Peck's Green Nursery SiteOne Landscape
Landscaping Lndscape Supply
Vendor Location Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Hiawatha, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA
Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Line Item Description Qty Price | Extended Price | Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended Price Extended

Trees for Jones Golf Course
Black Hills Spruce 3 $110.00 $330.00§ $60.00 $180.00]  $168.75 $506.25 $80.00 $240.00 $135.00 $405.00 $90.00 $270.00 $161.05 $483.15
Serbian Spruce 4 $104.00 $416.00§ $60.00 $240.000 _ $200.00 $800.00 $80.00 $320.00 $139.00 $556.00 no bid $161.05 $644.20)
Freeman Maple 1 $171.00 $171.00§ $120.00 $120.00] _ $237.50 $237.50§  $130.00 $130.00 $196.00 $196.00 $185.00 $185.00 $162.05 $162.05
Red Maple 1 $176.00 $176.00§ $120.00 $120.00] _ $200.00 $200.00§  $130.00 $130.00 $201.00 $201.00 $265.00 $265.00 $162.05 $162.05
Sugar Maple 1 $154.00 $154.00§ $120.00 $120.00] _ $237.50 $237.50)  $125.00 $125.00 $206.00 $206.00 $260.00 $260.00 $162.05 $162.05
Red Horsechestnut 2 $179.00 $358.000 no bid $487.50 $975.00 no bid no bid no bid $177.05 $354.10)
Common Horsechestnut 2 $161.00 $322.000 no bid $375.00 $750.00 no bid $201.00 $402.00 no bid $177.05 $354.10)
Royal Frost Birch 3 $146.00 $438.00§ $100.00 $300.00] _ $250.00 $750.00 no bid $123.00 $369.00 no bid $151.05 $453.15
Hackberry 3 $171.00 $513.000 no bid $300.00 $900.00§  $120.00 $360.00 $162.00 $486.00 $200.00 $600.00 $163.05 $489.15
Turkish Filbert 1 $198.00 $198.000 no bid $350.00 $350.00§  $100.00 $100.00 $188.00 $188.00 $220.00 $220.00 $193.05 $193.05
Kentucky Coffeetree 3 $169.00 $507.00§ no bid $237.50 $712.50§  $120.00 $360.00 $188.00 $564.00 $200.00 $600.00 $163.05 $489.15
American Hophernbeam 4 $191.00 $764.000 no bid $350.00] $1,400.00 no bid no bid $210.00 $840.00 $171.05 $684.20)
Sycamore 0 $158.00 $0.00] no bid $260.00 $0.00 no bid $235.00 $0.00 no bid $162.05 $0.00
English/White Oak 1 $191.00 $191.000 no bid $400.00 $400.00 no bid $143.00 $143.00 no bid $179.05 $179.05
Shingle oak 2 $171.00 $342.00§ $120.00 $240.00] _ $378.00 $756.00§  $120.00 $240.00 $214.00 $428.00 no bid $161.05 $322.10)
Chinkapin Oak 2 $181.00 $362.00§ $120.00 $240.00] _ $375.00 $750.00 no bid no bid no bid $161.05 $322.10)
Bald Cypress 2 $163.00 $326.00§ $85.00 $170.00]__ $400.00 $800.00§  $100.00 $200.00 $123.00 $246.00 no bid $161.05 $322.10)
Elm 2 $161.00 $322.00§0 no bid $325.00 $650.00§  $120.00 $240.00 $188.00 $376.00 $195.00 $390.00 $162.05 $324.10)
Tuliptree 1 $151.00 $151.00§ $120.00 $120.00] _ $275.00 $275.000  $110.00 $110.00 $188.00 $188.00 no bid $193.05 $193.05
Quacking Aspen 3 $169.00 $507.00§ $120.00 $360.00] _ $300.00 $900.00 no bid $188.00 $564.00 $165.00 $495.00 $161.05 $483.15
Weeping Willow 0 $124.00 $0.00] no bid $300.00 $0.00 no bid $162.00 $0.00 $170.00 $0.00 $151.05 $0.00
Arbovitae 0 $61.00 $0.00] $60.00 $0.00]  $100.00 $0.00 $65.00 $0.00 $72.00 $0.00 $59.00 $0.00 $87.05 $0.00
Crabapple 4 $130.00 $520.000 $75.00 $300.00]_ $190.00 $760.00 $85.00 $340.00 $136.00 $544.00 $180.00 $720.00 $139.05 $556.20)
Serviceberry 3 $201.00 $603.00§ $115.00 $345.000_ $220.00 $660.00 $90.00 $270.00 $209.00 $627.00 no bid $161.05 $483.15
Total Amount for Jones Golf Trees $7,671.00 $2,855.00 $13,769.75 $3,165.00) $6,689.00 $4,845.00 $7,815.40
Trees for Utilities
Jack Pine 0 $176.00 $0.00]  no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid $171.16 $0.00]
Eastern Red Cedar $121.00 $0.00 $0.00]  $250.00 $0.00 no bid $149.00 $0.00 no bid $71.16 $0.00
Sub: Hemlock 15 $80.00 $1,200.00
Serbian Spruce 15 $175.00| $2,625.00§ $60.00 $900.00] $200.00{ $3,000.00 $80.00| $1,200.00 $138.00| $2,070.00 no bid $155.16| $2,327.40
Concolor fir 0 $210.00 $0.00] $60.00 $0.00]  $275.00 $0.00 no bid $162.00 $0.00 $115.00 $0.00 $220.16 $0.00
Frasier Fir no bid $0.00]  $190.00 $0.00) no bid no bid no bid $221.16 $0.00]
Sub: White Spruce 15 $40.00 $600.00
White Pine 15 $101.00| $1,515.00§ $70.00| $1,050.00] $200.00| $3,000.00 $70.00| $1,050.00 $108.00| $1,620.00 $140.00| $2,100.00 $123.16| $1,847.40
Norway Spruce 15 $101.00| $1,515.00§ $60.00 $900.00] $190.00 $2,850.00 $80.00| $1,200.00 $124.00| $1,860.00 $90.00 $1,350.00 $224.16| $3,362.40
Arbovitae $0.00)
Sub: Emerald or Techny 15 $61.00 $915.00§ $60.00 $900.00] $100.00{ $1,500.00 $65.00 $975.00 $63.00 $945.00 $59.00 $885.00 $81.16 $1,217.40
Total Amount for Utilities Trees $6,570.00) $5,550.00 $10,350.00] $4,425.00 $6,495.00 $4,335.00 $8,754.60
Total Awarded Amount: $7,671.00] $5,550.00
Can you meet the May 10, 2016 delivery
deadline for Jones Golf Course Trees? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Can you meet the May 20, 2016 deadline for
Utilities Trees? Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes




BID TABULATION

Trees
Bid #PUR0216-144

March 14, 2016 at 3:00pm

Greg's Lawn &

Midwest Lawn &

SiteOne Landscape

VENDORS BladeWorks Fleming Nursery Landscaping Hughes Nursery Lndscape Peck's Green Nursery Supply
Vendor Location Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Hiawatha, IA Cedar Rapids, IA Cedar Rapids, IA
Local Business Certificate on File (Yes/No) Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
Line Item Description Qty | Price | Extended | Price | Extended | Price | Extended | Price | Extended Price | Extended Price | Extended Price | Extended
Warranty: See bid 1 year no warranty none no extended warranty no warranty
Estimated Delivery: weather dependent 7 days 30 days weather dependent 30-45 days see bid 2-10 days
See bid for
Notes: substitutions See bid for substitutions See bid for substitutions | See bid for substitutions
Signature Page
1 Do You Accept Credit Card for Payment? Yes, 3% fee Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes
2 Quick Pay Discount 1% 10 days N/A 3% 10 days N/A N/A N/A No
3 Does Discount Apply to MasterCard? No N/A Yes N/A N/A N/A Yes




