BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Fertilizers

Floratine Central Turf

Suppliers: D & K Products Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA - Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
SGN 220+ (fairway grade)
1 | 278 [32-3-10; 50-75% poly SCU 30-0-5 / 50% NSN no bid 32-3-10 55% PCSCU 33-3-6 50% SCU 32-0-10 (7:50/1"02;'31’)"'“3 2FE
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 230 240
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 0.780 $ 1.23 1.11
Unit Price:| $ 11.80 $ 19.80 | $ 16.89 17.75
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 3,280.40 $ 5,504.40| $ 4,695.42 4,934.50
1.1 32-3-10; 50-75% poly SCU 34-0-10 79% SCU
U.l. / SGN: 230
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:
Unit Price: $ 18.75
Rebate:
Extended Price: $ 5,212.50
2 | 13 |21-3-21: 75% Uflex 21-0-21 / 75% Uflexx no bid as specified 19-0-19 75% Uflex SOP 21-;-5; /gﬁ T;é’é%g;;m
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 220 240
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 1.350 $ 1.80 1.88
Unit Price:| $ 14.22 $ 19.00 | $ 24.00 19.74
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 184.86 $ 247.00] $ 312.00 256.62
3 32 [13-26-5; SCU, 100% amm sulfate no bid no bid as specified no bid 1&3‘;_/15205;302;%%8
U.l. / SGN: 220 240
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: $ 2.51 2.13
Unit Price: $ 16.35 19.18
Rebate:
Extended Price:| $ - $ 523.20| $ - 613.76
4 20 [6-2-0; 90-120 Milorganite as specified no bid 6-2-0 4% Fe Greens Grade Milorganite 50lb Milorganite 50lb
U.l. / SGN: 220 90 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 2.970 $ 0.410
Unit Price:| $ 8.91 $ 12.50 | $ 9.25 9.09
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 178.20 $ 250.00| $ 185.00 181.80
4.1 6-2-0; 90-120 Milorganite Milorganite 50lb Greens
U.l. / SGN: 100
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib:
Unit Price: $ 10.25
Rebate:

Extended Price:

$ 205.00




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Fertilizers

Floratine Central Turf

Suppliers: D &K P.roducts Products Pacg Supply River City Tgrf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
5 200 _Liir(r)ljajg% RXN or Utlexx; .43% as specified no bid as specified no bid 19'0;:,703;2?\(/2%‘213;/2)30%
U.l. / SGN: 220 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: 1.660 $ 2.10
Unit Price: 14.95 $ 18.95 $ 15.96
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,990.00 -1 $ 3,790.00| $ -1 % 3,192.00
6 | 670 |33-0-5; 100% RXN or Uflexx: 2% fe MOP as specified no bid as specified 34-0-10 79% SCU 30-3-7 960?#;’;’8’2"(')‘5 2FE SOP
U.l. / SGN: 220 220 230
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: 0.800 $ 1.30 $ 1.33
Unit Price: 14.05 $ 2150 | $ 18.75 | $ 19.99
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 9,413.50 -1 $ 14,405.00| $ 12,562.50 | $ 13,393.30
7 | 121 |46-0-0: Uflexx or similar stabilization as specified no bid as specified no bid 46-0-0 B;‘LSSSN(‘;:Q;'EQ'S;OO% U-
U.l. / SGN: 220 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: 0.900 $ 0.73
Unit Price: 20.70 $ 24.55 $ 16.84
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,504.70 - $ 297055 | $ - $ 2,037.64
8 47-0-0; Umaxx 46-0-0 Umaxx no bid no bid no bid no bid
U.l. / SGN: 220
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: 1.210
Unit Price: 28.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: - -1 $ -1 $ -1 $ -
SGN 75-120 (greens grade)
22-0-22; 100% nutralene (N release must . 21-0-22 100% Nutralene SOP . 18-0-18E 100% Polyplus 3mo
o 11 lbe equal) ( bz LI L IE no bid Micros no bid SOP 1.2fe .6mn (;/(5)98535)
U.l. / SGN: 90 90
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: 2.970 $ 3.32
Unit Price: 32.75 $ 37.00 $ 29.85
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 360.25 -1 $ 407.00| $ -1 $ 328.35




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Fertilizers

Floratine Central Turf

Suppliers: D & K Products Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA - Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
10 32 |Gypsum 100 SGN S04 mini Gypsum Greens Grade no bid as specified as specified Crown 50lb(zzgit'1§ed Gypsum
U.l. / SGN: 100 100
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib:
Unit Price:| $ 7.80 $ 6.20 | $ 949 $ 6.18
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 249.60 | $ $ 198.40 | $ 303.68 | $ 197.76
11 Limestone palletized 98G mini as specified no bid as specified Hi Cal Lime mini Pelletized Dolomitic Limestone
(#008979)
U.l. / SGN: 100 100
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:
Unit Price:| $ 7.50 $ 5.60 | $ 849 $ 5.31
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ - $ $ - $ - $ -
12 46 _(1:(3261)3 w/ Am Sulphate; 2% fe, minors Andersons 13-2-13 no bid no bid no bid 14'2'14(5023/5032? Fe Mn
U.l. / SGN: 100 100
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 4.300 $ 2.89
Unit Price:| $ 28.00 $ 20.22
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 1,288.00 $ 930.12
13 20 |[10-20-20; 50% nutralene SOP/micros as specified no bid 10-18-22 50% MU SOP Mic no bid no bid
U.l. / SGN: 100 90
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 6.940 $ 6.74
Unit Price:| $ 34.70 $ 33.70
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 694.00 | $ $ 674.00 | $ - $ -
14 13 é‘:izj;') 50% nutralene (N release must as specified 1o bid no bid no bid 12-2846134565'(\)/'0? (F;gggélzsdf;SMo
U.l. / SGN: 100 100
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 4.550
Unit Price:| $ 31.90 $ 27.84
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:| $ 41470 | $ $ - $ - $ 361.92
15 | a1 —;Olﬁf:é 221/"&"3)0'“” coated (Nrelease no bid no bid 22.0-22 60% MU SOP Micros no bid 1O O0E o r'?‘(’gg’;‘gssgg)‘o
U.l. / SGN: 90
Cost of Nitrogen/Ib: $ 3.36 $ 3.32
Unit Price: $ 33.65 $ 29.85
Rebate:
Extended Price:| $ -1 $ $ 1,043.15| $ -1 % 925.35




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Fertilizers

Suppliers:

D & K Products
Des Moines, IA

Floratine Central Turf
Products
Papillion, NE

Pace Supply
Fairfax, IA

River City Turf & Ornamental
Silvis, IL

SiteOne Landscape Supply
Cleveland, OH

Item #

Qty

Requested Analysis / Description

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

Bid

16

12

10-2-5; 35% humic acid (Grow Power)

no bid

as specified

no bid

no bid

no bid

U.l. / SGN:

100

Cost of Nitrogen/lb:

9.40

Unit Price:

47.00

Rebate:

Extended Price:

564.00

$ -

17

10

Huma-Cal soil conditioning product
SGN 120

no bid

no bid

SuperCal Humic Greens
Grade

no bid

no bid

U.l. / SGN:

90

Cost of Nitrogen/lb:

Unit Price:

$ 14.00

Rebate:

Extended Price:

$ 140.00

Other

18

0-0-50; Water Soluble

as specified

no bid

0-0-5 w/ 17%S Soluble Flne

no bid

0-0-50 100% SOP Sprayable
(#BS005050)

U.l. / SGN:

Cost of Nitrogen/lb:

Unit Price:

$ 35.00

$ 27.74

$ 25.52

Rebate:

2% VGM

Extended Price:

$ 210.00

$

$ 166.44

$ -

$ 153.12

19

400

20-0-8; with .067 Acelepryn XCU; 150-
220 SGN; 50% XCU/Uflexx PCSCU

as specified

Shaw's 21-0-4; 50% XRT
(slow); .067 Aceleprym

as specified

21-0-4 50% SCU .067
Acelepryn

20-0-5 Acelepryn .067%, 75%
PolyPlus 2Fe (#291610)

U.l. / SGN:

220

220

Cost of Nitrogen/lb:

4.17

$ 3.05

Unit Price:

$ 2.830
$ 28.30

& |H

43.80

$ 33.57

$ 34.89

$ 28.04

Rebate:

2% VGM

Extended Price:

$ 11,320.00

17,520.00

$ 13,428.00

$ 13,956.00

$ 11,216.00

20

30

28-8-18; Sprayable fertilizer

Plant Maruel 38-8-18; Bent

no bid

28-8-18 Water Soluble

no bid

28-7-14 Macron 25#

U.l. / SGN:

Cost of Nitrogen/lb:

$ 3.470

Unit Price:

$ 24.30

$ 22.90

$ 25.63

Rebate:

2% VGM

Extended Price:

$ 729.00

$ 687.00

$ 768.90

21

0-0-15; Gro-Power, High K+Calcium, 200

SGN

no bid

as specified

no bid

no bid

no bid

U.l. / SGN:

200

Cost of Nitrogen/Ib:

Unit Price:

42.00

Rebate:

Extended Price:




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Fertilizers

Floratine Central Turf

Suppliers: D & K Products Products Pace Supply River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA - Fairfax, IA Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
18-3-7; Gro-Power Premium Green; ER . . . . .
22 200 sGN no bid as specified no bid no bid no bid
U.l. / SGN: 200
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: $ 5.55
Unit Price: $ 52.00
Rebate:
Extended Price:| $ - $ - - $ - -
23 11-2-9; Gro-Powr Prem Green; Fe+Mn no bid as specified no bid no bid no bid
U.l. / SGN: 200
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: $ 8.64
Unit Price: $ 47.50
Rebate:
Extended Price:| $ - $ - - $ - -
24 30 [Humega (Gallon) no bid as specified no bid no bid no bid
gal U.l. / SGN: 30 gal drum
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:
Unit Price: $ 299.00
Rebate:
Extended Price:| $ - $ 299.00 - $ - -
Combination Fertilizers
25 —‘i?r;qo;s?oo:ﬁ)&?grsag; 122:253)/5:6 as specified Shaw's 36-0-6; 100% Slow as specified no bid no bid
U.l. / SGN: 220 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 4850 | $ 4.97 5.11
Unit Price:| $ 63.10 | $ 89.50 66.50
Rebate: 2% VGM
Usage rate per acre: 175 Ib/acre 150 Ib/acre 175-350 Ib/acre $ - -
251 26-0-5; 90% Duration with .15% 4-Mo Feed, .167 Dim, .067
' dimension & .058% Acelepryn ACE
U.l. / SGN: 150
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: $ 5.08
Unit Price: $ 91.50
Rebate:
Usage rate per acre: 150 Ib/acre $ - -
26 _“3?5055?01:&&?%;&8& 122;[2;;:/0 as specified Shaw's 30-0-0, 100% as specified no bid no bid
U.l. / SGN: 220 220
Cost of Nitrogen/lb:| $ 4130 | $ 5.16 4.37
Unit Price:| $ 66.20 | $ 77.50 70.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Usage rate per acre: 150 Ib/acre 175-350 Ib/acre $ - -




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Fertilizers

D & K Products

Floratine Central Turf

Pace Supply

Supoliers: Products River City Turf & Ornamental| SiteOne Landscape Supply
PP ’ Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A Silvis, IL Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE
Item #| Qty |Requested Analysis / Description Bid Bid Bid Bid Bid
261 32-0-5; 81% Duration with .15% ERT - 3 Mo. Feed, .167 Dim,
’ dimension & .058% Acelepryn .067 ACE
U.l. / SGN: 150
Cost of Nitrogen/lb: $ 5.57
Unit Price: $ 83.50
Rebate:
Usage rate per acre: 150 Ib/acre $ - $ -
Pricing firm for full season of contract? Yes Yes No No Yes
If no, date for mid-season price review: July 1, 2016 July 1, 2016
Lead time for delivery: 1-2 days April 1 - April 15 5-10 days 1-5 days 1 week
Certified local business? Yes No Yes No Yes
Accept pcard? Yes Yes Yes No Yes
Quick pay discount: none none none none none




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

. D & K Products Floratine Central Turf Pace Supply River City Turf & SiteOne Landscape Supply
Suppliers: . Products . Ornamental
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
PHOSPHITE
1 |0-0-30 Stress Phiter Fungicide 19 as specified Fort: Phite no bid Phyte Off 0-0-18 Green Flo Phyte
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2-30z 3-6 0z 1-3 0z 30z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 92.00 | $ 125.00 $ 96.85 | $ 103.60
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 1,748.00 | $ 2,375.00 $ 1,840.15 | $ 1,968.40
FUNGICIDES
2 |Torque Fungicide (Cleary) 4 Tebuconazole no bhid as specified Tebuconazole Tebuconazole
Application Rate per 1000 sqgft:] gal .6-1.1 oz .6 0z .6 0z .6 0z
Package Size: 5x1 gal 5x1 gal 5x1 gal 5x1 gal
Price per Package: $ 240.00 $ 717.40 | $ 270.00 | $ 290.20
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 192.00 $ 573.92 | $ 216.00 | $ 232.16
3 |Daconil Flowable Weatherstik (Syngenta) 17.5 Echo 720 no bhid as specified Echo 720 Daconil Action
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 2-5.5 0z 2-5.5 0z 2-5.5 0z 4-5.4 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 156.00 $ 342.65 | $ 185.00 | $ 380.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 546.00 $ 1,199.28 | $ 647.50 | $ 1,330.00
4 ProStar 1 as specified no bid as specified no bid ProStar 70 WDG
Application Rate per 1000 sqgft:| cs 1.5-4.5 oz 1.5-450z 1.5-3 ox
Package Size: 4x3 lbs 4x3 Ibs 4x3 Ibs
Price per Package: $ 641.00 $ 765.20 $ 694.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 641.00 $ 765.20 $ 694.00
5 Renown Fungicide (Syngenta) 10 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 450z 2.5-45 0z 2.5-4.5 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 1,030.00 $ 1,131.85 $ 1,030.00
Rebate: no
Extended Price: $ 2,060.00 $ 2,263.70 $ 2,060.00
6 |Tartan Fungicide 2 as specified no bid as specified no bid Tartan Stressguard
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1-2 0z 1-20z 1-2 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 1,980.00 $ 2,129.00 $ 1,980.00
Rebate: no
Extended Price: $ 3,960.00 $ 4,258.00 $ 3,960.00




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
7 Tourney 35 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] Ib .2-.37 0z .20z .18-.37 oz
Package Size: 4x5 Ib bottle 4x5 b bottle 4x5 b bottle
Price per Package: 2,771.00 3,113.40 $ 2,771.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 4,849.25 5,448.45 $ 4,849.25
8 Instrata 6.5 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2.75 0z 2.75-11 oz 2.75-6 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 680.00 879.10 $ 680.00
Rebate: no
Extended Price: 4,420.00 5,714.15 $ 4,420.00
9 |Banol Fungicide (propamocarb) 3 Proplant no bid as specified Proplant as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.3-4 0z 1.3-4 0z 1.5-4 0z
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: 584.00 952.06 564.00 | $ 1,011.50
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,752.00 2,856.18 1,692.00 | $ 3,034.50
10 |Chlorothanil Zn Daconil Zn no bid Chlorothanil 500 Zn Echo Zn Daconil ZN Syngenta
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 20z 3.50z 1.5-8 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 250.00 183.95 17250 | $ 250.00
Rebate: no
Extended Price:
11 |Chlorothanil weatherstik 25 Echo 720 no bid Chlorothanil DF Echo Ultimate Manicure Ultra 82.5%
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2-550z 2-5.5 Ib/acre 2-50z
Package Size: 4x5 Ibs 2x10 Ib 4x5 lbs 4x5 Ibs
Price per Package: 156.00 174.60 119.60 | $ 124.20
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 3,900.00 4,365.00 2,990.00 | $ 3,105.00
12 [|lprodine 4 Chipco 26019 no bid Chipco 26019 no bid 18 Plus Lesco
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 3-40z 3-80z 3-80z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 187.00 211.80 $ 208.32
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 748.00 847.20 $ 833.28




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
13 |Mefenoxam 4 as specified no bid as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .5-1 0z 12-24 oz .49-.98 oz
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: 660.00 746.78 | $ 672.00 | $ 823.56
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,640.00 2,987.12 | $ 2,688.00 | $ 3,294.24
14 |Endorse 1 Clearys Affirm no bid Affirm WDG no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2.4 Ib/acre 3x241b
Package Size: 3x11 Ibs 3x11 Ibs
Price per Package: 649.00 729.27
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 649.00 729.27
15 |Propiconazole 6 Prokoz Fathom no bid Fathom as specified Spectator Ultra 1.3 Lesco
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1-2 0z .5-4 0z 1-40z
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: 122.00 136.22 | $ 12450 | $ 122.54
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 732.00 817.32 | $ 747.00 | $ 735.24
16 |Syngenta Heritage 2 as specified no bid as specified Endow 2SE as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .2-.4 0z .2-.4 0z .38-.77 oz
Package Size: 6x1 Ib 6x1 Ib gallon (=4lb Heritage) 6x1 Ib
Price per Package: 1,902.00 2,045.16 | $ 750.00 | $ 1,902.00
Rebate: no
Extended Price: 3,804.00 4,090.32 | $ 2,250.00 | $ 3,804.00
17 |Bayleton 50% WSP 2 as specified no bid as specified no bid Bayleton 50WSP
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs .5-1 0z 5-20z .25-1 0z
Package Size: 4x1.375 |Ib 4x1.375 1b 4x5.5 oz
Price per Package: 510.00 526.24 $ 143.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,020.00 1,052.48 ?
18 |Secure (fluazinam) 2.5 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 5oz 5oz 50z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 2,915.00 3,068.40 $ 2,915.00
Rebate: no
Extended Price: 1,457.50 1,534.20 $ 1,457.50




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
19 |Banol (propamocarb) Proplant no bid as specified Proplant as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1.3-4 0z .75-3 0z 1.5-4 oz
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: 584.00 952.06 564.00 | $ 1,011.50
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
20 |Emerald (Boscalid) 2 as specified no bid as specified no bid Emerald 70Eg 0.49#
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 49 Ib/A .13-.18 oz 49 Ib
Package Size: 10x.49 Ib 10x.49 Ib 10x.49 Ib
Price per Package: 1,479.80 1,591.10 $ 1,479.80
Rebate: no
Extended Price: 2,959.60 3,182.20 $ 2,959.60
21 |Trifloxystrobin Compass no bid Interface no bid Compass 50WDG
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: .36 0z 3-7 0z .1-.25 0z
Package Size: Ib 2x2.5 gal 1lb
Price per Package: 390.00 848.90 $ 386.04
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
22 |lprodione 12.5 Chipco 26019 no bid Chipco 26019 no bid 18 Plus Lesco
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 3-4 0z 2-4 0z 3-80z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 187.00 211.80 $ 208.32
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 467.50 529.50 $ 520.80
23 |[Interface (Trifloxystrobin) 4 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 3-70z 3-70z 4-7 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 772.50 848.90 $ 772.50
Rebate: no
Extended Price: 3,090.00 3,395.60 $ 3,090.00
24 |Propiconazole Prokoz Fathom no bid Fathom as specified Spectator Ultra 1.3 Lesco
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1-2 oz 5-4 0z 1-4 0z
Package Size: 2x1 gal 4x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: 122.00 272.44 12450 | $ 122.54
Rebate: 2% VGM

Extended Price:




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
25 |Prokoz Mainsail 360 Docket DF no bid no bid Echo Ultimate Manicure Ultra 82.5%
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| Ib 1.8-3.2 oz 1.92-3.25 oz
Package Size: 4x5 Ib 4x5 Ib 4x5 1b
Price per Package: 125.00 119.60 | $ 124.20
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,250.00 2,152.80 | $ 2,235.60
26 [Velista (penthropyrad) as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 22 0z/A .3-.7 0z
Package Size: 6x22 0z 6x22 0z 1x22 oz
Price per Package: 1,155.00 1,326.60 $ 192.50
Rebate: no
Extended Price:
27 |Xzemplar (Fluxapyroxad) as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 11.4 0z/A 11.4 oz .21-.26 oz
Package Size: 2x114 oz 2x11.4 oz 2x11.4 oz
Price per Package: 3,296.88 300.26 $ 189.58
Rebate: no
Extended Price:
28 |Fore 80 WP rainshield (Mancozeb) as specified no bid as specified as specified Mancozeb dg Lesco
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 4-8 0z 4-8 0z 4-8 0z
Package Size: 8x6 Ib 8x4x1.5 Ib 8x4x1.5 Ib 4x12 Ib
Price per Package: 355.20 447.36 304.00 | $ 217.64
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
29 |Kabuto Fungicide SC (Isofetamid) as specified no bid as specified no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 21.78 0z/A A4-50z
Package Size: 6x21.78 oz bottle
Price per Package: 636.00 119.10
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
INSECTICIDES
30 [Imidacloprid 56 Zenith 75 WSP no bhid Merit 75 wp-wsp Mallet Bandit 2F 1 gal
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 6.4 0z/A 2.1 oz/acre 150z .6 0z/M; 1G/5A
Package Size: 4x4x1.6 0z 4x4x1.6 0z 4x4x1.6 0z gallon
Price per Package: 63.00 263.42 62.49 | $ 61.12
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 3,528.00 14,751.52 3,499.44 | $ 3,422.72




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
31 Acelepryn insecticide (Chorantrantiliprole as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
chemical class)
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 8 0z/A 8 oz/acre
Package Size: 4x64 oz 4x64 o0z 4x64 0z
Price per Package: 3,798.00 3,997.88 $ 3,798.00
Rebate: no
Extended Price:
32 33280;()6'29 Insecticide (Trichlorfon chemical as specified no bid as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 3 1b/1000 3 1b/1000 3 1b/1000
Package Size: 30 Ib bag 30 Ib bag 30 Ib bag 30 |b bag
Price per Package: 34.30 3598 | $ 39.99
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
33 Elr:svsa)unt insecticide (Indoxacarb chemical 80 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| o0z 2 0z/A .046-.275 oz
Package Size: 12 oz 10 oz cont. 12 oz
Price per Package: 81.40 $ 89.83
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 542.67 $ 598.87
34 |Tempo SC 900 ml 900 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| ml 6 0z/A .27-.54 oz 4-8 ml/1000
Package Size: 900 ml 900 ml 900 ml
Price per Package: 139.30 $ 145.96
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 139.30 $ 145.96
35 |TREEage (4% Emamectin Benzoate) 4 no bid no bid no bid no bid TREEage Arborjet
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: L based on DBH
Package Size: 8x1L
Price per Package: $ 4,248.40
Rebate:
Extended Price: $ 2,124.20
36 |ArborMectin (4% Emamectin Benzoate) as specified no bid no bid no bid TREEage G4 Arborjet
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: same as TREEage
Package Size: Qt Qt
Price per Package: 480.00 $ 458.00
Rebate: 2% VGM

Extended Price:




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
HERBICIDES
37 |Baracade 4 FL herbicide 16 Evade 4L no bid as specified Cavalcade 65 WDG Stonewall 65WDG
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 21 oz/Acre .5-1.10z .185-.55 oz 1-1.25 Ib/acre
Package Size: 4X1 gal 4x1 gal 10 Ib bag (=1.626gal) 10 lbs
Price per Package: 288.000 642.68 115.00 | $ 99.60
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,152.00 2,570.72 1,131.61
38 S;'?iz Pro Roundup herbicide, Glyphosate 4 Roundup Custom 53% no bid as specified as specified Prosecuter Pro
Application Rate per 1000 sgft:] cs 20z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 4x6.8 Ib 6.8 Ib jug 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 110.00 319.32 7498 | $ 97.60
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 440.00 ? ? $ 390.40
39 [Pendimethalin 3.3 EC 6 as specified no bid as specified Pendulum 3.3EC Pre-M 3.3ec Turf
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.3-1.8 0z 1.3-1.8 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 156.25 189.05 159.95 [ $ 151.68
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 937.50 1,134.30 959.70 | $ 910.08
40 |Tenacity 3 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal .11-.18 oz .11-.18 oz 5-8 oz/acre
Package Size: 4 gallcase 4 gallcase 4 gallcase
Price per Package: 3,044.00 3,204.50 $ 3,044.00
Rebate: no
Extended Price: 2,283.00 2,403.38 $ 2,283.00
41 |Bensumec 4If 175 as specified no bid as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 5.6-7.3 0z 5.6 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 510.00 606.75 499.95 | $ 597.10
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,785.00 2,123.63 1,74983 | $ 2,089.85
42 |Dow Dimension (generics acceptable) Dimension 2EW no bid Dimension 2EW Dimension 2EW Dimension 2EW
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: .28-.55 oz .28-.55 oz .28-.55 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 1,157.50 1,153.80 1,15750 | $ 1,157.50
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ - - - $ =




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
43 |Drive XLR8 2 as specified no bid as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.45 oz 1.450z 1.450z
Package Size: 4x64 oz 4x64 oz 4x64 oz 4x64 oz
Price per Package: 228.00 265.24 227.98 376.84
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 456.00 530.48 455.96 753.68
44 |Quincept (Confront) 2 as specified no bid as specified Quincept Confront
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 2-3 0z 2-3 0z .37-.74 oz
Package Size (2x2.5 gallon): 4X1 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5gal 4x1 gal
Price per Package: 230.00 525.75 228.25 526.92
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 460.00 1,051.50 913.00 1,053.84
44.1 |Quincept (Confront) Confront
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:
Package Size (2x2.5 gallon): 4x1 gal
Price per Package: 496.00
Rebate:
Extended Price: 992.00
45 |Aquaneat (Rodeo, non select herb) Roundup Custom 53% no bid as specified Roundup Custom ATU as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1.5-3 0z 1.5-3 0z 1.5 pts/acre
Package Size (30 gallon): 2.5gal 2.5¢gal 2.5gal 2.5 gal
Price per Package: 55.00 51.30 46.47 63.06
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
46 |Prokoz Vessel Trimec 1 as specified no bid as specified Triplet Three-way Selective
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1.1-150z 150z 150z
Package Size (2x2.5 gallon): 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 99.50 140.55 114.98 117.16
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 99.50 140.55 114.98 117.16
47 |Prokoz Vessel Trimec 30 as specified no bid as specified Triplet Three-way Selective
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 1.1-150z 150z 150z
Package Size (30 gallon): 30 gal 30 gal 30 gal 30 gal
Price per Package: 568.50 816.90 689.88 584.21
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 568.50 816.90 689.88 584.21




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
48 |Prokoz Vessel Trimec 55 as specified no bid as specified Triplet Three-way Selective
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 1.1-1.50z 150z 150z
Package Size (55 gallon): 55 gal 55 gal 55 gal 55 gal
Price per Package: 1,037.85 1,474.00 1,264.78 | $ 1,071.05
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,037.85 1,474.00 1,264.78 | $ 1,071.05
49 |Prokoz Glyphosate Pro as specified no bid as specified Glyphosate 41% Prosecutor Pro
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1.5-3 0z 1.5-30z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 87.00 80.45 7490 | $ 97.60
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
50 |Quick Silver 5 as specified no bid as specified no bid as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| bottle .021-.154 oz .9-1.50z
Package Size: 8 0z bottle 8 0z bottle 8 0z bottle
Price per Package: 123.00 141.95 $ 129.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 615.00 709.75 $ 645.00
51 [Preen (Trifluralin) 2 as specified no bid no bid Treflan .5G Snapshot 2.5 tg 50 Ib
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| drums 2-31b
Package Size: 17 b drum 40 Ib bag 50 Ib bag
Price per Package: 33.00 28.00 | $ 77.61
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 66.00 2380 | $ 52.77
52 |[Dicamba Vessel (2-4-D, MCPP) Vessel Trimec no bid Prokoz Vessel Triplet Eliminate Lo
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1.1-150z 150z 150z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 99.50 140.55 11498 | $ 203.04
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: - - - $ -
53 [Dicamba Vessel (2-4-D, MCPP) 2 Vessel Trimec no bid Prokoz Vessel Triplet Eliminate Lo 30gal
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| drums 1.1-150z 150z 150z
Package Size: 55 gal drum 55 gal 55 gal 30 gal
Price per Package: 1,037.85 1,474.00 1,264.78 | $ 1,091.32
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 2,075.70 2,948.00 2,52956 | $ 4,001.51




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

. D & K Products Floratine Central Turf Pace Supply River City Turf & SiteOne Landscape Supply
Suppliers: . Products . Ornamental
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
54 |Q4 Plus as specified no bid as specified as specified Q4 Plus PBI Gordon
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 30z 30z 30z
Package Size: gallon gallon gallon gallon
Price per Package: $ 97.00 $ 108.85 | $ 93.99 | $ 109.29
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ - $ - $ - $ -
55 |Tordon RTU (Streets Maintenance) as specified no bid as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: varies
Package Size: 1 gt bottle 1 gt bottle 1 gt bottle 1 gt bottle
Price per Package: $ 13.44 $ 1420 | $ 13.39 | $ 13.03
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ - $ - $ - $ =
56 |Sahara DG (Streets Maintenance) Mohave DG no bid as specified as specified Mojave 70eg 5Ib
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 10 Ib/Acre 10 Ib/Acre 5-10 Ib/acre
Package Size: 10 Ib bag 10 Ib bag 10 Ib bag 51b
Price per Package: $ 132.00 $ 11490 | $ 150.00 | $ 44.36
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ - $ - $ - $ =
GROWTH REGULATORS
57 |Trim It 2 SC (Paclobutrazol) 1 Trimmit no bid no bid Tide Paclo Tide Paclo 2sc pgr
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal .14-74 oz 6-32 oz/acre
Package Size: 4X1 gal 1 gallon 4X1 gal
Price per Package: $ 438.00 $ 224.00 | $ 782.32
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 109.50 $ 224.00 | $ 195.58
58 [|Proxy growth regulator 25 as specified no bid as specified Ethophon Ethephon 2 SL Pgr
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 50z 50z 50z
Package Size: 2.5 gal cont. 2.5 gal cont. 2.5 gal cont. 2.5 gal cont.
Price per Package: $ 72.50 $ 9255 | % 46.88 | $ 76.64
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 725.00 $ 925.50 | $ 468.80 | $ 766.40
59 [Trinexapac Ethyl 3 T-Nex 1 AQ no bid Primo Max Groom T-Nex 1 Aq Pgr
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal .25-1.5 oz varies .125-1 o0z
Package Size: 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal 2x1 gal
Price per Package: $ 215.00 $ 637.36 | $ 228.00 | $ 250.06
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 322.50 $ 956.04 | $ 342.00 | $ 375.09




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
60 |Legacy plant growth regulator as specified no bid as specified no bid Legacy Turf pgr
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 50z 50z 5-22 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 1,900.00 $ 2,043.00 $ 1,900.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
AQUATICS
61 |Aquatic Blue pond dye 20 no bid Select Source / Aqua Blue | Mirage Blue Pond Dye - WSB as specified Admiral Liquid Aquatic
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 4-6 0z/A 1 gal / 4 acre ft of wtr
Package Size: 4X1 gal 4X1 gal 4x1 gal 4x1 gal
Price per Package: $ 4450 | $ 121.72 100.00 | $ 147.04
Rebate:
Extended Price: $ 22250 | $ 608.60 500.00 | $ 735.20
62 [Copper Sulfate 2 as specified no bid as specified as specified Applied Bio (f;)rl)é)er Sulphate
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| bags varies
Package Size: 50 Ib bag 50 Ib bag 50 Ib bag 151b
Price per Package: 98.00 $ 122.50 $92 fine / $102 coarse $ 47.90
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 196.00 $ 245.00 $184 / $204 $ 319.33
63 |Aqua Sweep (w-4-D, Triclopyc) 1.5 as specified no bid as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1-2 oz 1-2 0z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 197.50 $ 228.30 197.25| $ 226.08
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 296.25 $ 342.45 29588 | $ 339.12
64 |Reward (diquat) 2.5 as specified no bid as specified Diquat Diquat Spc2l Nufarm
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal .05-2 gal/surface acre
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal 2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 395.00 $ 467.15 165.00 | $ 294.10
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 197.50 $ 233.58 165.00 | $ 147.05
65 |Aquashade 10 as specified no bid as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 1 gal/4A ft 1 gal/4A ft
Package Size: 4X1 gal 4X1 gal 4x1 gal 4x1 gal
Price per Package: 138.40 $ 162.28 14950 | $ 37.58
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 1,384.00 $ 1,622.80 1,495.00 | $ 375.80




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
66 [Natural Pond Cleaner 2 Spectrum no bid no bid Spectrum no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| cs 3-6 Ib/Acre
Package Size: 24x8 oz 24x8 0z
Price per Package: $ 420.00 399.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 840.00 798.00
67 |Clipper (Flumioxazin) as specified no bid as specified no bid Clipper 1lb
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1 Ib per surface acre 1 Ib per surface acre
Package Size: 11lb ax1 Ib 1lb
Price per Package: $ 139.30 782.55 $ 139.30
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
WETTING AGENTS
68 |Tri Cure AD (Polyepoxide) 60 as specified no bid no bid Magnaplex no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 4-6 0z 50z
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 347.00 250.00
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 4,164.00 3,000.00
69 |Tri Cure Micro 62.5 as specified no bid no bid no bid no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:] gal 8-12 oz
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 223.55
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 2,794.38
70 |Primer Select 15 as specified no bid no bid Magnus Lesco-Wet Plus 2.5 gal
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:| gal 4-6 0z 40z
Package Size: 5 gal cont. 5 gal cont. 2.5gal
Price per Package: $ 282.50 375.00 | $ 70.19
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: $ 847.50 1,125.00 | $ 421.14
71 |Fortify Forte no bid no bid Duplex no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: .30z 20 oz/Acre
Package Size: 6x64 0z 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: $ 1,440.00 225.00
Rebate: 2% VGM

Extended Price:




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
SPRAY ADDITIVE
72 |Cornbelt Premier 90 NIS 80 no bid as specified FS Aqua Light no bid
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 1/4-1/2 pint / 100 gal
Package Size: 6x1 gal 6x1 gal 2.5 gal jug
Price Per Gallon: 82.50 143.58 38.75
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
73 |Shake down defoamer Shakedown Defoamer Select no bid Knockdown Defoamer Recede Lesco antifoam
Application Rate per 1000 sqft:
Package Size: 12x1 gt 12x1 gt 12x1 gt
Price per Package: 168.00 14.00 150.00 | $ 44.28
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
74 [New Balance PH adj. New Balance FP-747 / Floratine no bid no bid Lesco Conform Ph adj
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: 80z / 100 gal
Package Size: 6x1 gal 2.5 gal 6x1 gal
Price per Package: 198.00 102.50 $ 154.98
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
75 |Foam alot Foam a lot no bid Foam Marker (CB) no bid Lesco Foam Marker
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: varies
Package Size: 4x1 gal 4x1 gal 4x1 gal
Price per Package: 112.00 81.08 $ 103.60
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price:
75.1 |Foam alot Foam Marker - Ultra Mark
Application Rate per 1000 sqft: varies
Package Size: 4x1 gal
Price per Package: 66.60
Rebate:
Extended Price:
BIOSTIMULANTS
. ProteSyn/Floratine; . . .
76 |Ajinomoto GreenNcrease (6-0-0) 55 Green Increase . no bid no bid no bid
6-2-3 + Aminos
Application Rate per 1000 sqgft:| gal 14 oz 3 0z/1000
Package Size: 2x2.5 gal 2x2.5 gal
Price per Package: 90.00 152.50
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 990.00 1,677.50




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals

Floratine Central Turf

River City Turf &

Suppliers: D &K P_roducts Products Pacg Supply Ornamental SiteOne Landscape Supply
Des Moines, IA . Fairfax, 1A o Cleveland, OH
Papillion, NE Silvis, IL
Item # [Product Name/Description Est. Bid Bid Bid Bid No Bid
Usage
MOLE BATE
77 |Talpirid mole bate 1 as specified no bid as specified as specified as specified
Application Rate per 1000 sqgft:| box
Package Size: 20/box 20/box 20/box 20/box
Price per Package: 37.50 42.35 42.00 33.27
Rebate: 2% VGM
Extended Price: 37.50 42.35 42.00 33.27
Pricing firm for full season of contract? Yes Yes No Yes Yes
If no, date for mid-season price review: July 1
Lead time for delivery: 1-2 days 24-48 hrs 3-7 days 1-3 days 1 week
Certified local business? Yes No Yes No Yes
Accept pcard? Yes Yes Yes No Yes
Quick pay discount: none none none none none




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM
TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Fertilizer by Vendor

Requested Analysis / Description

Product to be supplied

Price per bag

D & K Products

32-3-10; 50-75% poly SCU 30-0-5 50% NSN $ 11.80
21-3-21; 75% Uflex 21-0-21 75% Uflexx $ 14.22
6-2-0; 90-120 Milorganite 6-2-0; Milorganite SGN 220 $ 8.91
18-0-4; 50% RXN or Uflexx; .43% barricade 18-0-4 25% RXN .43 barricade $ 14.95
33-0-5; 100% RXN or Uflexx; 2% fe MOP 33-0-5 100% RXN 2% FE MOP $ 14.05
46-0-0; Uflexx or similar stabilization 46-0-0 Uflexx $ 20.70
47-0-0; Umaxx 46-0-0 Umaxx $ 28.00
22-0-22; 100% nutralene (N release must be equal) 21-0-22 Greens Grade 100% Nutralene $ 32.75
13-2-13; w/ Am Sulphate; 2% fe, minors (AGG) Andersons 13-2-13 Amm Sulphate $ 28.00
14-28-10; 50% nutralene (N release must be equal) 14-28-10; 50% nutralene $ 31.90
26-0-5; 90% duration with .15% dimension & .058% Acelepryn 26-0-5; 90% duration with .15% dimension & .058% Acelepryn $ 63.10
32-0-5; 81% Duration with .15% dimension & .058% Acelepryn 32-0-5; 81% Duration with .15% dimension & .058% Acelepryn $ 66.20
Pace Supply

32-3-10; 50-75% poly SCU 32-3-10 55% PCSCU $ 19.80
21-3-21; 75% Uflex 21-3-21 75% Uflexx $ 19.00
13-26-5; SCU, 100% amm sulfate 13-26-5; SCU, 100% amm sulfate $ 16.35
6-2-0; 90-120 Milorganite 6-2-0 4% Fe + Greens Grade SGN 90 $ 12.50
Gypsum 100 SGN So4 mini Gypsum 100 SGN So4 mini $ 6.20
Limestone palletized 98G mini 98 G Mini $ 5.60
10-20-20; 50% nutralene SOP/micros 10-18-22 50% MU SOP Micros $ 33.70
Huma-Cal soil conditioning product SGN 120 SuperCal Humic Greens $ 14.00
28-8-18; Sprayable fertilizer 28-8-18 Water Soluble $ 22.90
SiteOne Landscape Supply

20-0-20; 50% Polymer coated (N release must be equal) 098535 / 18-0-18E 100% PP $ 29.85
0-0-50; Water Soluble 0-0-50 100% SOP Sprayable (BS005050) $ 25.52
20-0-8; with .67 Acelepryn XCU; 150-220 SGN; 50% XCU/Uflexx PCSCU 291610/Acelepryn .67%, 20-0-5 75% PP $ 28.04




BID TABULATION FORM - JANUARY 12, 2016 AT 3:00 PM

TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals by Vendor

Product Name/Description

Product to be supplied

Package Size

Price Per Package

D & K Products

Phosphite 0-0-30 Stress Phiter Fungicide Stress Phiter 2x2.5 gal $92.00
Fungicides Torque Fungicide (Cleary) Tebuconazole 5x1 gal $240.00
Daconil Flowable Weatherstik (Syngenta) Echo 720 2x2.5 gal $156.00
ProStar Prostar 4x3 Ib $641.00
Renown Fungicide (Syngenta) Renown 2x2.5 gal $1,030.00
Tartan Fungicide Tartan 2x2.5 gal $1,980.00
Tourney Tourney 4x5 b bottle $2,771.00
Instrata Instrata 2x2.5 gal $680.00
Banol Fungicide (propamocarb) Proplant 2x1 gallon $584.00
Iprodine Chipco 26019 2x2.5 gal $187.00
Mefenoxam Mefenoxam 2x1 gal $660.00
Endorse Clearys Affirm 3x11 Ib $649.00
Propiconazole Prokoz Fathom 2x1 gal $122.00
Syngenta Heritage Syngenta Heritage 6x1 Ib $1,902.00
Bayleton 50% WSP Bayleton WSP 4x1.375 Ib $510.00
Secure (fluazinam) Secure 2x2.5 gal $2,915.00
Emerald (Boscalid) Emerald 10x.49 Ib $1,479.80
Trifloxystrobin Compass 1lb $390.00
Interface (Trifloxystrobin) Interface 2 x 2.5 gallon $772.50
Prokoz Mainsail Docket DF 4x51Ib $125.00
Velista (penthropyrad) Velista 6x22 0z $1,155.00
Xzemplar (Fluxapyroxad) Xzemplar 2x114 oz $3,296.88
Kabuto Fungicide SC (Isofetamid) Kabuto 6x21.78 $636.00
Insecticides Acelepryn insecticide (Chorantrantiliprole chemical class) Acelepryn 4x64 0z $3,798.00
Dylox 6.2g insecticide (Trichlorfon chemical class) Dylox 6.2 G 30 |b bag $34.30
Provaunt insecticide (Indoxacarb chemical class) Provaunt 12 oz $81.40
Tempo SC 900 ml Tempo SC 900 900 ml $139.30
Herbicides Pendimethalin 3.3 EC Pendimethalin 3.3 EC 2 x 2.5 gallon $156.25
Tenacity Tenacity 4 gallcs $3,044.00
Bensumec 4lf Bensumec 4LF 2x2.5 gal $510.00
Dow Dimension (generics acceptable) Dimension 2EW 2x2.5 gal $1,157.50
Drive XLR8 Drive XLR8 4x64 oz $228.00
Quincept (Confront) Quincept 4x1 gal $230.00
Prokoz Vessel Trimec Prokoz Vessel 2x2.5 gal $99.50
Prokoz Vessel Trimec Prokoz Vessel 30 gal $568.50
Prokoz Vessel Trimec Prokoz Vessel 55 gal $1,037.85
Prokoz Glyphosate Pro Prokoz Glyphosate Pro 2x2.5 gal $87.00
Quick Silver Quicksilver 8 0z bhottle $123.00
Preen (Trifluralin) Preen 17 Ib drum $33.00
Dicamba Vessel (2-4-D, MCPP) Vessel Trimec 2x2.5gal $99.50
Dicamba Vessel (2-4-D, MCPP) Vessel Trimec 55 gal drum $1,037.85
Q4 Plus Q-4 Plus gallon $97.00
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TURF CARE PRODUCTS (RFB #PUR1215-102) - Chemicals by Vendor
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Product to be supplied

Package Size

Price Per Package

Growth Regulators |Trim It 2 SC (Paclobutrazol) Trimmit 4 x 1 gallon $438.00
Proxy growth regulator Proxy 2.5 gal cont. $72.50
Trinexapac Ethyl T Nex 1 AQ 2x1 gal $215.00
Legacy plant growth regulator Legacy 2x2.5 gal $1,900.00
Aquatics Copper Sulfate Copper Sulfate 50 Ib bag $98.00
Aqua Sweep (w-4-D, Triclopyc) Aquasweep 2x2.5 gal $197.50
Aquashade Aquashade 4 x 1 gallon $138.40
Natural Pond Cleaner Spectrum 24 x 8 oz $420.00
Clipper (Flumioxazin) Clipper per Ib $139.30
Wetting Agents Tri Cure AD (Polyepoxide) Tricure AD 2x2.5 gal $347.00
Tri Cure Micro Tricure Micro 2x2.5 gal $223.55
Primer Select Primer Select 5 gallon cont. $282.50
Fortify Forte 6x64 0z $1,440.00
Spray Additive Cornbelt Premier 90 NIS 80 6x1 gallon $82.50
Bio Stimulant Ajinomoto GreenNcrease (6-0-0) GreenNcrease 2 x 2.5 gallon $90.00
SiteOne Landscape Supply
Fungicides Renown Fungicide (Syngenta) Renown 2x2.5 gal $1,030.00
Tartan Fungicide Tartan Stressguard 2x2.5 gal $1,980.00
Tourney Tourney 4x5 Ib bottle $2,771.00
Instrata Instrata 2x2.5 gal $680.00
Chlorothanil weatherstik Manicure Ultra 82.5% 4x5 Ib $124.20
Syngenta Heritage 74240 / Syngenta Heritage 6x1 Ib $1,902.00
Secure (fluazinam) 47148 / Syngenta / Secure 2x2.5 gal $2,915.00
Emerald (Boscalid) Emerald 70Eg 0.49# 10x.49 Ib $1,479.80
Interface (Trifloxystrobin) Interface 2 x 2.5 gallon $772.50
Velista (penthropyrad) Velista 6x22 0z $1,155.00
Fore 80 WP rainshield (Mancozeb) Mancozeb dg Lesco 4x12 Ib $217.64
Insecticides Imidacloprid Bandit 2F 1 gal gallon $61.12
Acelepryn insecticide (Chorantrantiliprole chemical class) Acelepryn 4x64 0z $3,798.00
TREEage (4% Emamectin Benzoate) 040-4100N / Arborjet / Treeage 8x1L $4,248.40
ArborMectin (4% Emamectin Benzoate) TREEage G4 Arborjet Quart $458.00
Herbicides Baracade 4 FL herbicide Stonewall 65WDG 10 Ib bag $99.60
Quick Pro Roundup herbicide, Glyphosate 48.7% Prosecuter Pro 2x2.5 gal $97.60
Tenacity Tenacity 4 gallcs $3,044.00
Dow Dimension (generics acceptable) Dimension 2EW 2x2.5 gal $1,157.50
Aquaneat (Rodeo, non select herb) Aquaneat 2.5 gallon $63.06
Tordon RTU (Streets Maintenance) Tordon RTU 1 gt bottle $13.03
Sahara DG (Streets Maintenance) Mojave 70 eg 5 Ib bag $44.36
Aquatics Aquatic Blue pond dye Admiral Liquid Aquatic 4x1 gal $147.04
Reward (diquat) Diquat Spc2l Nufarm 2 x 2.5 gallon $294.10
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Spray Additives Shake down defoamer Recede Lesco antifoam 12x1 gt $44.28
New Balance PH adj. Lesco Conform Ph adjuster 6 x 1 gallon $154.98
Foam a lot 013706 / Lesco Foam Marker 4 x 1 gallon $103.60
Mole Bate Talpirid mole bate Talpirid mole bate 20 per box $33.27




